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GOALS ACCOMPLISHMENTS 

  

To promote effective communication and 
mutual understanding among the Classified 
staff, students, faculty, and administrators.  
 

This is a work in progress and is ongoing.   
Developed and maintain Classified Senate 
website.  Utilize portal for announcements and 
email system to communicate to the 
community. 

To develop and adopt a Constitution and 
Bylaws. 
 

Completed. 

To establish a document titled “Delineation of 
Duties” between the SEIU Local 99 and the 
Classified Senate. 
 

This is a work in progress.  A rough draft was 
sent to the SEIU for review.  Pending feedback. 

To explore ways to expand access to 
professional development for staff (funds, 
release time, etc.). 

This is a work in progress.  This is a SEIU 
negotiable issue. 

To develop individual leadership among the 
Classified staff.  
 

Sent two representatives to the Classified 
Leadership Institute.   
 
Sponsored and Organized Annual Holiday 
Luncheon. 
 
Received Model Senate Award from the 
California Community Colleges Classified 
Senate (4CS). 

To promote recognition of, and appreciation 
for, the value and contribution of Classified 
staff to the learning environment and the 
campus community.  
 

Held a recognition/farewell ceremony for all 
staff leaving the College.   
 
Donated funds to the Classified Employee 
Scholarship. 

To represent the interests of the Classified staff, 
on non-bargaining issues, in the development 
and formulation of College policies and 
procedures. 

President continues to serve and is an active 
participant on the District Consultation 
Council. 
 

To establish working Committees & Task Forces 
(Sunshine, Fundraising, etc.) 
 

Several Committees were formed during the 
2009-10 Academic Year.   Meetings were held 
to discuss Committee business.  This continues 
to be an ongoing goal. 
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