
Accessible parking. Guests and graduates can
access accessible parking by exiting the freeway
at Collins Road, turning right on Campus Park
Drive, and turning left at the Delfin Street signal
and following the directional signage. Accessible
parking is available on a first-come, first-serve
basis. These lots will be opened as general
parking at 5:00 p.m., when the ceremony
begins, should there be any available spots.

Graduate and guest parking. Graduates and
their guests may park in any other nearby
parking lots or structures, including the lot
surrounding the field hockey stadium, the
parking structure and its adjacent lots, and the
High School at Moorpark College parking lot,
among others identified on this map. Parking is
free. Guests should not park in surrounding
neighborhoods.

Graduate staging area. Graduates must arrive 
no later than 4:30 p.m. to the grassy area
between the soccer fields and the stadium
fieldhouse to receive further instructions
regarding the ceremony and procession.

Guest seating. The stage will be centered on
the far-end of the stadium end-zone, allowing
guests to sit on either side of the bleachers.
Accessible seating will be in the front rows and
identified by placards. Golf carts will be
available to help shuttle guests from the
Accessible parking lot to the stadium entrance.
A limited number of wheelchairs will be
available for loan on a first come, first serve
basis to assist guests to the accessible seating.

Stadium entrance. Gates to Griffin Stadium will
open 90 minutes before the ceremony begins, at
3:30 p.m. Seating is available on a first-come,
first-serve basis. Accessible seating will be in the
front two rows of both sets of bleachers.
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